pECISION MVJ/42 - 16
of the Shareholder owning
voting shaves of the Joint Stock Company
Mangistaumunaigaz (Address of the JSC Mangxstaumunaxgaz
bld 1mkd.6, Aktau 130000, Mangistau region, the Republic of
Kazakhstan)

Lreerabere 27, 2016
Mangistau Investments B.V., a company with iimitcd
liability incorporated according 1o Netherlands legislation, with

its registered office at Strawinskylaan 727, 1077 XX
Amsterdam, the Netherlands up to , 2016 is a
shareholder owning all voting shares of the JSC
Mangistaumunaigaz.

Location and requisites JSC “Mangistaumunaigaz™

address - bld. 1, mkd.6, Aktau 130000, Mangistau region, the

Republic of Kazakhstan, Bank Details - RNN 430 100 000 245,

BIN 990 140 000 483 dated 14.10.2004., JSC “Citibank of

Kazakhstan”, Almaty SWIFT BIC: SITIKZKA,

IIC KZ6983201T0250161034 (ienge)

Whereas:

~ in accordance with paragraphs 4 of the article 35 of Lhe Law
of the Republic of Kazakhstan “About the Joint Stock
Companies” dated 13.05.2003 Ne 415-I (hereinafter the
Law), the Company, all voting shares of which belonging to a
sole shareholder, do not hold general sharcholders meetings.
All decisions on the issues related to the competence of the
general shareholders meeting on the basis of the Law and (or)
the Chartcr) shall be made by this sole shareholder and be
executed in writing only if these decisions do not prejudice
and impose limitations on the rights certified with the
privileged share;

- in accordance with paragraph 17 of Appendix 3 of the
Sharcholders’ agreement dated April 15, 2009, subparagraph
17) of paragraph 52 of Article 14 of JSC Mangistaumunaigaz
Charter the approval of annual work programs or the
Company's budgets as well as changes to them fall within the
competence of the Sole sharcholder of JSC
Mangistaumunaigaz;

- JSC Mangistaurnunaigaz Board of Directors’ submission on
the issue of approval of JSC Mangistaumunaigaz adjusted
budget for 2016 was considered

hereby resolves:

1. To confirm the adjusted consolidated budget of JSC

Mangistaumunaigaz for 2016 in enclosed edition (Appendix
Nel). |

The signed copy of the present written decision by Managing
Directors is equal to the original.

This Rcsoluhon will be kcpt in the Company’s records.
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By: Mr. Bian Dezhi/ Bnan Juuks:
Title:* Managing Director A/
Yrnpasamowsh Jupexrop A
1 ¥
By: Mr. Zhu Wei /Mxy Bait
Title: Managing Director A/
Vrpasnsmowni Jupexrop A

F Y, 4

PEWEHME N [ /K- /€
AKUHOHEDA, BIaJEOiero
FONIOCYIOLIHMH AKUHSME
akumoHepHoro ofimectsa «Manrucraymysaiirasy
{mMecro vaxoxknenns AQ «Maurucraymynaitraay: Pecriy6nnka
Kasaxcran, Maurucrayckan obnacrs, 130000, r. Axray, MKpH.6,

3nanue 1)
P4 2016 .

[lo cocrosmmo Ha 2016r. Bce ronocyOwMe aKuUuy
AxuponiepHoro obuiecrsa «ManrucraymyHaiirasy (aanee
OOIecTs0) NpHHAICKAT KOMMaHWMM «Mangistau Investments
B.V.», co3aauHHOH B COOTBETCTBHH ¢ 3aKOHOUATENLCTBOM
Hepepnaiios, HMEKOUIEH 3aper1cTpHpOBaKHblH OQUC 10 agpecy:
Crpasunckuiinaan727, 1077XX Awmcrepmam, Hunepnanmst
(Strawinskylaan 727, 1077 XX Amsterdam, the Nctherlands).

Mecto naxoxzenus 1 peksu3nTs AO «MasrucraymyHairas»:
Pecniy6nuka Kazaxcraw, Manrncrayckas oGnacre, 130000, r.
Axkray, Mkp. 6, sgaume 1; OankoBckHe pexBu3uTL: PHH
430 100 000 245, BUH 990140 000 483 or 14.10.2004r. AO
«Curnbank Kasaxcraw» r. Anmart SWIFT BIC: CITIKZKA,
WUK KZ6983201T0250161034 (Tenre)

IockonuKy:

- B COOTBETCTBMH C MyHKTOM 4 cTaThu 35 3akona Pecrnybnuku
Kasaxcran «O6 axumonepupix ofmectsax» or 13 mas 2003
roga Ne 415-I1 (nanee - 3axoK) B ofiuecTse, BCE roIOCYrOLIHE
4KLWH KOTOPOro TPHHALNEKAT OJIHOMY aKUHOHepy, obume
cobpanus akIMOREPOB HE MPOBOAATCS. Pellienus no sonpocam,
OTHeCeHHBIM 3akoHoM # (ww) ycrasoM ofmecrsa K
KoMnereHurH obuwero cobpaHHA aKIMOHEPOB, NPUHUMAIOTCH
TAKHM KLHOHEPOM CAMHOAHYHO M HOATeXaT ofopMASHMIO B
MHCHMEHHOM BHIE IPH YCJIOBHM, YTO JTH Delenus He
YUISMIAKT H HC OrpaHM4MBaKd npaea, YAOCTOBCDCHHbLIC
IPHBIIETHPOBAHHBIMH AKUNHAMH;

~ B cootBercTeuu ¢ 0. 17 [lpuaoxenns 3 [orosopa akUKOHEPOB
or 15.042009 r., nn. 17) n. 52 cr. 14 Ycrasa AO
«MaHrucTayMyHairasy  yTBepKIeHWC TOmOBHIX paboumx
nporpamm WM Giomkeros OOmecTsa, a TAKKE H3MEHCHMH B
HHUX OTHOCHMTCA K KOMICTCHUMH EIMHCTBEHHOro aKuMOHCDpa
AO «MaurucraymyHa#rasy,

- obpawenne Cosera aupextopos AO «MaurucraymyHairasy
110 BONPOCY YTBEPIKASHUS CKOPPEKTHpOBaHHOIO GromkeTa Ha
2016 ron AO «ManricTayMyHairas» pacCMOTPEHO,

HACTOSIIINM NPHEHMAIOT pelesne:

1. VYTBepAMTE  CKOPPEKTHPOBAHHBIN  KOHCOAMAWPOBAHHbIA
Giomxer AO «Manrucraymynaiirasy wa 2016 ron B
npwiaracmoit peaaxumu (IpunoxerneNal).

MonnucaiHas ynpaBnsioMMy AvpexTopamu Komnawu xonus
HACTOAMIErO  TMHMCHMEHHOIO  peIIeHHA MPHPABHMBACTCA K
OpHIHHANY. Py

Hacrosiuee pemexnne Gym:'r xpaum'scx B 3anucax Komnaunu.

2 e

By: abayev D./Kapabaes JI.C.
Title{Managifig Director B/

Ynpasnmownit Jupexrop B
By: Mr. Otmar Carolus / Ormap Kapoaye

Title: Managing Director B/
Ynpasnmomuit Jupexrop B

Ne27-02-131/17/10/2016
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pecision V4 /12 1€

of the Shareholder owning
voting shaves of the Joint Stock Company
Mangistaumunaigaz (Address of the JSC Mangistaumunaigaz:
bld., 1mkd.6, Aktau 130000, Mangistau region, the Republic of
Kazakhstan)

Oercriboe g7 16
Mangistau Investments B.V., a company with Hmited
liability incorporated according to Netherlands legislation, with

its registered office at Strawinskylaan 727, 1077 XX
Amsterdam, the Netherlands up to , 2016 is a
shareholder owning all voting shares of the JSC
Mangistaumunaigaz.

Location and requisites JSC “Mangistaumunaigaz™:

address - bld. 1, mkd.6, Aktau 130000, Mangistau region, the

Republic of Kazakhstan, Bank Details - RNN 430 100 000 245,

BIN 990 140 000 483 dated 14.10.2004., JSC “Citibank of

Kazakhstan”, Almaty SWIFT BIC: SITIKZKA,

1IC K76983201T0250161034 (1enge)

Whereas:

- in accordance with paragraphs 4 of the article 35 of the Law
of the Republic of Kazakhstan “About the Joint Stock
Companies” dated 13.05.2003 Ne 415-II (hereinafter the
Law), the Company, all voting shates of which belonging to a
sale shareholder, do not hold general sharcholders meetings.
All decisions on the issues related to the compelence of the
general sharcholders mecting on the basis of the Law and (or)
the Charter) shall be made by this sole sharcholder and be
executed in writing only if these decisions do not prejudice
and impose limitations on the rights certified with the
privileged share;

- in accordance with paragraph 17 of Appendix 3 of the
Shareholders’ agreement dated April 15, 2009, subparagraph
17) of paragraph 52 of Article 14 of JSC Mangistaumunaigaz
Charter the approval of annual work programs or the
Company's budgets as well as changes to them fall within the
competence  of the Sole  sharcholder of JSC
Mangistaumunaigaz;

—~ JSC Mangistaurnunaigaz Board of Directors’ submission on
the issue of approval of JSC Mangistaumunaigaz adjusted
budget for 2016 was considered

hereby resolves:

1. To cenfirm the adjusted consolidated budget of ISC

Mangistaumunaigaz for 2016 in enclosed edition (Appendix
Nel).

The signed copy of the present written decision by Managing
Directors is equal to the original.

This Resolution will be kept in the Company’s records,
{
—
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By:  Mr. Biln Dezhi/ Buan Jbikst

Title: Managing Direclor A/
Vnpasmsiouii [inpexrop A

By: Mr. Zhu Wei /[y Bofi

Title: Managing Director A/

Ynpassmownit [{upexiop A

VM

' PELUEHHME Ne d//-/ (6
AKUIOHEPA, BAajeoueroe
FOIOCYIONUHMH AKIISIMI
ARUHOHCPHOro o01eeTBa «VIAUrHCTaY MYHAHT a3
(Mecro naxosaenna AO «ManrdcraymyHalirasy: Pecny6inka
Kasaxcran, Maunructayckas obmacrs, 130000, r. Akray, MkpH.6,
3nanme 1)
« 1'7 » /og 2016 .
[lo cocToammo Ha 2016r. Bce romocylowme akuuu

Axuioneproro obmecrsa  «ManrucraymyHaiiras» (nazee

OfwiecT30) npHHAWICKAT KOMMNAHHKM «Mangistau Investments

B.V.», co3nanuoit B COOTBETCTBHH ¢ 3aKOHOMATEILCTBOM

Hynepnainos, nyeroulel 3aperucTpHpoBantbli oduc 1o anpecy:

Crpasuncruivraan727, 1077XX  Amcrepzam, Hunepnannst

(Strawinskylaan 727, 1077 XX Amsterdam, the Netherlands).
Mecto naxoxaenss ¥ peknuantsi AO «MarrHeTayMyHaiiras»:

Pecry6auxa Kaszaxcran, Maurnucrayckas obnacts, 130000, r.

Axtay, Mkp. 6, spamie |; OanxosckHe pexBu3Minl: PHH

430 100 000 245, BUH 990140 000483 ot 14.10.2004r, AO

«Curnbank Kazaxcrann r. Anmatei SWIFT BIC: CITIKZKA,

MUK KZ6983201T0250161034 (Tenre)

IMocronnry:

- B COOTBETCTBMH C NMYHKTOM 4 c¢TaTbH 35 3akoHa Peciybuniu
Kasaxcran «O6 akumomnepusix obmectsax» or 13 masn 2003
rona Ne 415-I1 (nanee — 3aKoK) B 00iecTBe, BCE FOIOCYIOIIHE
KUMKW KOTOPOrO NPHHAAEKAT OAHOMY aklHOHepy, obue
coOpanHa aKLMONCPOB He npososTes. Pelelus no ponpocass,
oTHeceHHEIM  3akoHoM M (M) ycTaBoM o6mecrsa K
KOMMeTeHUIH obluero cofpaHia akIMOHEPOB, NPHHUMAIOTCS
TAKHM AKUHOHEPOM CAMHOIHYHO M HOLICAHAT OQOPMICHUIO B
MHCHMEHHOM BHAC LIPH  YCJIOBHM, YTO OTH pelueniyi He
YUIEMASKOT H HC OpaHHYMBAKO npapa, YAOCTOBCPCHHBIC
NPHBILIECHPOBAITHBIMY AKUHAMHY;

- 8 cooteeTcTBiH ¢ 1. 17 Ilpunoxenns 3 JloroBopa axusoHepos
or 15042009 r, nn. 17) n. 52 c¢r. 14 VYeraza AO
«ManrncTayMyHaiirasy  yTBepiAenHe TrofoBeix  paboumx
nporpamy Win 610ce1os OOLecTsa, a Takke H3MCHCHHI B
HUX OTHOCHTCA X KOMICTCHUMY EAHHCTBEHHOr0 4KUMOHCpPA
AQ «MaHrucraymyHairasy,

~ obpauwcHite Coszera aupextopob AO «Maurucray yHairasy
10 BOMPOCY YTBCPKUSHHA CKOPPEKTHPOBAHHOIO Gromkera Ha
2016 rox AO «MaHricTayMyHaifras» paccMOTpeHo,

HACTOSIIINM NPHHHMAIOT PEleHiie:

1. YToepauTh  CKOPPERTHPOBAHHBIH  KOHCOAHMAUPOHAHHbIM
Glonker AO «Manrucraymynaiirasn wa 2016 ron o
npiutaraemoii peaakupy (IpunoikenneNal).

[Monnucainas YOpPaBUIOWHMH AKPEKTOPAMH KoMnanuu xomns
HACTOSRINETO MHCBbMCHHOI'O  peUICHHA npHpanuxsacica X
OpHruuamy.

Hacrosiee perenne Oyaer Xpanurses 8 3anucax Komnaniu.

By: Mr.Karaba.ycv D./Kapadaen J.C.
Tite:Managing Director B/
Yupasnaiownit Jupexrop B

By:  Mr,/Otmar Carolus / Otyvap Kapoaye
Title: Mdnaging Dircctor B/
Ynpasnmonuii Jupextop B

Ne27-02-131/17/10/2016



